NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

THE UNITED REPUBLIC OF TANZANIA

No. 13 oF 1991

‘ MSSENT,

ENACTED by the Parliament of the United Republic of Tanzania.

1. This Act may be cited as the Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties' gnort title
Amendments) Act, 1991.

2. The various Laws set forth in the first and second columns of the Amend-

Schedule to this Act are hereby amended in the manner specified in the ™ents of
e - certain
third column.

Laws



COLUMN 1

Acts 1965
No. 33

(Cap. 591)

Cap. 378

Cap 337

Act, 1967
No. 34

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

2 No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991

COLUMN 2

The National Archives Act, 1965

The Town Planning Ordinance

The Societies Ordinance, 1954

The Prisons Act, 1967

SCHEDULE

COLUMN 3

Section 12 is amended:

(a) by deleting the words ‘ten thousand shillings’ and substituting for them the words
“three hundred thousand shillings or imprisonment for a tcrm not exceeding two yeqrs.”

(b) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and substituting for them the ‘words
“fourty thousand shillings or imprisonment for a term not exceeding two years.”

Section 69 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “four thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “fourty thousand shillings™.

Section 71 is amended by deleting the words “five thousand shillings” and “one hundred
shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings and
one thousand shillings”.

Section 78 is amended ifi subsection (2) by deleting the words “four thousand shillings”
and “forty shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “fourty thousand
shillings” and “five hundred shillings”.

Section 27 is amended: ,

(a) In subsection (3) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and substituting for
them the words, “five thousand shillings”.

(b) In subsection (5) by delsting the words “one thousand shillings” and substituting for
them the words “twenty thousand shillings”.

Section 30 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “twenty shillings” and

substituting for them the words “one hundred thousand shillings” and “four thousand

shillings for every day during which the society operates”.

Section 81 is amended by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and substituting for
them the words “five thousand shillings”. '

Section 84 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “six months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand shillings” and “two years”.



NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

. Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991 3

No. 13
Act, 1967 The National Industries (Licensing and
No. 10 Registration) Act, 1967
Acts, 1987 The Patents Act, 1987
No. 1
Acts, 1972 The Business Licence Act, 1972
No. 25

Section 87 is amended—

(a) In subsection (1) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and “one year” and
substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand shillings” and “two years”.

(b) In subsection (2) by deleting the words “four thousand shillings” and “two years” and
substituting for them respectively the words “ten thousand shillings” and “five years”.

Section 89 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “six months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand shillings” and “two years™.

Section 90’is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “six months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand shillings” and “two years”.

Section 91 is amended by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and “three months”,
and substituting for them respectively the words “three thousand'shillings” and “one year”.

Section 92 is amended: (i) by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and substituting
for them the words “three thousand shillings” (ii) by adding the words “or to imprisonment
not exceeding one year or to both such fine and imprisonment.”

Section 93 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “two months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “two thousand and “six months™.

Section 25 is amended by deleting the words “fifty thousand shillings” and substituting
for them the words “one hundred thousand shillings”. :

*Section 69(1) is amended—
(i) By deleting the words “one hundred thousand shillings” and three years and substitu-
ting for them respectively the words “five hundred thousand shillings” and “five years”.

(ii) by adding the following “and forfeiture of the goods made through that patent”.
Section 17(1) is amended by deleting the words “fifteen thousand shillings and substituting
them the words “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 19 is amended by adding at the end of the proviso the following: “every officer
is liable to a fine not exceeding “ten thousand shillings for each offence”.



CoLumN 1

Cap. 213

Cap. 212

4

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991

COLUMN2

The Business Names (Registration) Ordi-
nance Cap. 213

The Companies Ordinance Cap. 212

SCHEDULE—(contd.)

CoLumn 3

Section 13 is amended by deleting the words “one hundred and fifty shillings” and substitu-
ting for them the words “two hundred shillings”.

Section 14 is amended by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and substituting for
them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 16 is amended by deleting the words “three months” and “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them respectively the words “one year” and “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 17 is amended by deleting the words “three months” and “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them respectively the words “one year” and “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 18 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and substituting
for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 20 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and substituting
for them the words “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 7 is amended in subsection (7) by deleting the words “two hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 24 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “twenty shillings” and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 25 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “twenty shillings” and
substituting for them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 28 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the. words “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 36(3) is amended in paragraph (b) by deleting the words “ten thousand shillings
and substituting for them the words “one hundred thousand shillings”.



NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991 5

Section 41 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 44 is amended in subsection (5) by deleting the words “five hundred shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.
5

Section 46 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “twenty thousand shillings”.

Section 47 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “twenty thousand shillings”.

Section 55 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “ten thousand shillings”.

Section 61 is amended: (i) by deleting the words “one year” and substituting for them
the words “three years”; (ii) by deleting the full stop at the ‘end of the last paragraph and
adding the following words “............. not exceeding “fifty thousand shillings™.

Section 67 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “hundred shillings™ and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 68 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings™
and substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings™.

-4

Section 72 is amended by deleting the words “seven years™ and substituting for them the
words “fourteen years.”

Section 73 is amended; (i) in subsection (1) by deleting the words “three years™ and
substituting for them the words “five years™ (ii) in subsection (2) by deleting the words
“three years” and substituting for them the words “five years™.

Section 74 is amended in subsection (4) by deleting. the words “one hundred shillings™
and “four hundred shillings™ and substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand
shillings™ and “one thousand shillings™.

Section 80 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings™
and substituting for them the words “two thousand shillings™.



CoLumn1

6

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991

COLUMN 2

SCHEDULE—(contd.)

CoLumn 3

Section 81 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings™
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings™.

Sectlon 83 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words ~two thousand shillings™
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings™.

Section 86 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one hundred shitlings™
and substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings™.

Section 88 is amended in subscetion (2) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings™
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings™.

Section 93 is amended: (i) in subsection (2) by deleting the words one hundred shillings
and substituting for them the words “one. thousand shillings™. (ii) in subscction (3) h\
deleting the words ~one_thousand shillings™ and substituting for them the words “five
thousand shillings™.

Section 94 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings™ and
substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings™.

Section 95 is amended in subsection (6) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings™ and
substituting for them the words “two thousand shitlings™.

Section Y9 is amended in subsection 3 by deleting the words “fourty shillings™ wherever they
appear in that subscction and substituting for them the words “two hundred shillings™.
Section 112 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words ~one thousand shillings™ .md
substituting foe: them the words “ten thousand shillings™. ;
Section 113 is amended in subscction (9) by deleting the words ~“one thousand shillings” and
substituting for them the words “ten thousand shillings™.

Scction 118 is amended in subscction (5) by deleting the words “hundred shillings™ and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings™.

Section 121 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “fourty shillings wizcrever
they appear in that subsection and substituting for them the words “five hundred shiilings™.



NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991 7

Secﬁon 122 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “six months” and “four
thousand shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “one year” and
“fifty thousand shillings™.

Section 123 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “six months” and “four
thousand shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “one year” and
and “ten thousand shillings™.

Section 129 is amended in subsection (4) by deleting.the words “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 135’is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one hundred shlllmgs
and substituting for them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 141 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “ten thousand shillings”.

Section 142 is amended in subsection (5) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 143 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “ten thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 147 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “two hundred shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings™.

Section 151 is amended in subsection (4) by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and
“twenty shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “one thousand
shillings” and one hundred shillings™.

Section 180 is amended (i); in subsection (5) by deleting the words two hundred shillings
.and substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings” (ii) in subsection (7) by deleting
thg words four hundred shillings” and substituting for them the words “one thousand
shillings”. -

Section 213 is amended in subsection (4) by deleting the words “two years” and “ten
thousand shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “five years” and
“one hundred thousand shillings”.

Section 216 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 230 is amended in subsection 2 by deleting the words “two hundred shillings and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 232 is amended (i) in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings™,
and substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

(ii) in subsection (5) by deleting the words “hundred shillings” and substituting for them the
words “five hundred shillings™.



CoLumn 1

8

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13  Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991

CoOLUMN2

SCHEDULE—(contd.)

CoLum3;

Section 234 is amended in subsection (6) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and
substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 240 is amended in subsection (2) by deletmg the words “two hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “one thousand

Section 246 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “two hundred shillings”.

Section 265 is amended in subsection (1) in paragraphs (1), (m), (n) and (q) by deleting
the words “five years” and substituting for them the words “three years”.

Section 267 is amended by deleting the words “two years” and substituting for them the
words “five years”.

Section 269 is amended (i) in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one year” and sub-
stituting for them the words “three years”; (ii) in subsection (4) by deleting the words “two

years” and ten thousand shillings” and substxtut.mg for them respectively the words'five
years’and. “one hundred thousand shillings.

Section 274 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “four hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “ten thousand shillings”.

Section 277 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and
substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 278 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “four hundred shillings” ahd
substituting for them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 282 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings and
substituting for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 286 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and
substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 288 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “four hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “one thousand shillings”.

Section 290 is amended in subsection (4) by deleting the words “one hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “two hundred shillings”.



Cap

297

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

_No. 13 Penal Reform (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991 9

The Factories Ordinance Cap. 297

Section 320 A is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “twenty thousand
shillings” and “five years” and substituting for them respectively the words “one hundred
thousand shillings” and “seven years”.

Section 327 is amended in the fourth line by deleting the words “one thousand shillings”
and substituting for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

Section 326 is amended in subsection (paragraph) (g) by deleting the words “ten thousand
shillings” and substituting for thém the words “fifty thousand shillings™.

Section 331 is amended in subsection (5) by deleting the words “four thousand shillings”
and “ten thousand shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “ten
thousand shillings” and fifty thousand shillings”.

Section 331 E is amended:—

(1) in paragraph (2) by deleting the words “twenty thousand shillings” and substituting for
them the words “five hundred thousand shillings”.

(ii) in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one thousand shxllmgs and substituting

for them the words “five thousand shillings”.

(iii) in subsection (4) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings™ and substituting for

them the words “five thousand shllhngs

Section 335 is amended by deletmg the words “three years” and substituting for them the
words “ten years”.

Section 336 is amended by deleting the words “seven years” and substituting for them
the words “fifteen years”.

Section 337 is amended by deleting the words “one hundred shillings” and substituting_
for them the words “five hundred shillings”.

Section 339 is amended in subsection (1) by deleting the words “onc hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “ten thousand shillings”.

Section 9 is amended in subsection (3) by deletmg the words “twp thousand shillings”

and “three months” and substmmng for them respectwely the words “fifty thousand”
shillings” and twelve months.

Section 76 is amended by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and “one month” and
substituting for them respectively the words “twenty thousand shillings” and “six months”.

Section 78 is amended by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and “three months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “two hundred thousand shillings” and
“ten months”.



CoLumn 1

Cep. 574

Cap. 263

Cap. 487

Cap. 366

10

NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Refbrm (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991

CoLUMN2
Security of Employment Act, 1964

Workmen'’s Compensation Ordinance

The Severance Allowance Act, 1962

The Employment Ordinance Cap. 366

Land StrveyQrdinance, Cap 390

SCHEDULE—(contd.)

CoLumn 3

Secuon 50 is amended by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and substituting for
them the words “twenty five thousand shillings”.

Section 43 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “three months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “fifteen thousand shillings” and “twelve
months”.

Section 12 is amended by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and “three thousand
shillings” and substituting for them respectively the words “five thousand shillings” and “ten
thousand ) - shillings”.
Section 60 is amended by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and “one year” and
substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings and three years”.
Section 127 is amended by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and “three months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “twenty five thousand shillings” and
three years”.

Section 4 is ded in subsection (3) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings” and
“six months” and substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings™
§nd “twelve months”.

Section 6 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “five hundred shillings” and
substituting for them the words “two thousand shillings”.

Section 9 is amended by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and “three months”
and substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings” and “two years”.
Section 11 is amended in subsection (1) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and
“threc months” and substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings”
and two years”.

Section 12 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “five thousand shillings” and
“six.months" 4nd substituting for them respectively the words “two hundred thousand
shillings” and ;‘two years”.

Section 15 is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and
substituting for them the words “fifty thousand shillings” or to imprisonment for a term
not exceeding twelve months”.




NAKALA MTANDAO (ONLINE DOCUMENT)

No. 13 Penal Refo_fm (Miscellaneous Penalties Amendment) 1991 11

Section 16is amended in subsection (2) by deleting the words “two thousand shillings and
substituting for them the words “fifty thousand shillings or imprisonment for a term not
exceeding twelve months”.

Section 31 is amended in subsection (3) by deleting the words “one thousand shillings” and
“two moal;”ths” and substituting for them respectively the words “fifty thousand shillings and
“one year”. ‘

Passed in the National Assembly on the nineteenth day of April, 1991.

......................................

Clerk of The National Assembly





